
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 4, 2022
For: Annual Contract for Plumbing Fixtures and Parts for San Antonio Airport System Local Local

Reece Supply AKA Morrison Supply SouthTexas Faucet Parts Ltd dba Faucet 
Parts

6100014970 LS 10130 Jones Maltsberger 1109 Fresno Dr

Item
Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

San Antonio,
TX, 78216                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       
210-344-4436

San Antonio,
TX, 78201                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                
210-733-3583

A Delete

A1 Zurn Lav Fct Aqua-Fit Bat Powered 1 Hole LF CP
Model # Z6950-XL-S

10

Unit Price $307.94 294.38
Extended Price $3,079.40 $2,943.80
Product # Z6950-XL-S Z6950-XL-S
Product Name Zurn Battery Faucet Zurn Faucet

A2 Zurn Behive Strainer
Model # Z5978-FTR

15

Unit Price $46.87 $46.88
Extended Price $703.05 $703.20
Product # Z5978-FTR Z5978-FTR
Product Name Beehive Strainer Zurn Strainer

A3 Zurn Omni-FloTM Back Spud Urinal 0.125 gpf to 1.0 gpf 
Model # Z5765-U

10

Unit Price $192.50 $312.50
Extended Price $1,925.00 $3,125.00
Product # Z5765-U Z5765-U
Product Name Back Spud Urinal Zurn Urinal

A4 Zurn - HET Concealed, Wall Hung Ecovantage® Flush Valve Toilet with 
ZurnSHIELDTM Glaze
Model # Z5617-BWL

10

Unit Price $134.70 $151.25
Extended Price $1,347.00 $1,512.50
Product # Z5617-BWL Z5617-BWL
Product Name HET Concealed Toilet Zurn Toilet

A5 Zurn Aqua-Sense Hardwire Powered Faucet
Model # Z6915-XL-CWB

10

Unit Price $276.47 $254.38
Extended Price $2,764.70 $2,543.80
Product # Z6915-X-CWB Z6915-XL-CWB
Product Name Aqua Sense Faucet Zurn Faucet

A6 Zurn - AquaSense AVTM ZEMS Series-Automatic Systems Sensor-Operated 
AquaVantage Flushometer – Water closet 
Model # ZEMS6152AV

10

Unit Price $409.38 $397.60
Extended Price $4,093.80 $3,976.00
Product # ZEMS6152 Av ZEMS6152
Product Name Aqua Flushometer Closet Zurn Flush Valve

A7 Zurn - - AquaSense AVTM ZEMS Series-Automatic Systems Sensor-Operated 
AquaVantage Flushometer – Urinal
Model # ZEMS6195AV

10

Unit Price $409.38 $611.57
Extended Price $4,093.80 $6,115.70
Product # ZEMS6195 Av ZEMS6159
Product Name Aqua Urinal Flushometer Zurn Flush Valve

A1-7 SUBTOTAL $18,006.75 $20,920.00

B Delete

B1 Spears 3x20ft PVC SCH40 Pipe
Model # PD-400-30

2

Unit Price $21.24 NO BID
Extended Price $42.48
Product # PD-400-30
Product Name Sch 40 pipe

B2 Spears 3 CPVC LW C/O ADPT W/ Plug SPGXFIP 
Model # P105X-030

10

Unit Price $43.48 NO BID
Extended Price $434.80
Product # P105X-030
Product Name Cpvc Adapter plug

B3 Spears 3 PVC DWV Combo WYE 1/8 Bend HXHXH Model # P501-030 2

Unit Price $136.04 NO BID
Extended Price $272.08
Product # P501-030
Product Name Combo Wye

B1-3 SUBTOTAL $749.36 NOBID
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C Delete

C1 1/2” X 1429” Blue PTFE Thread Sealing Tape
Model # 70885

20

Unit Price $3.13 $3.23
Extended Price $62.60 $64.60
Product # 70885 Millrose 70885
Product Name Blue PTFE Tape Millrose Tape

C2 3/4” X 1429” Blue PTFE Thread Sealing Tape
Model # 70886

20

Unit Price $4.26 $4.40
Extended Price $85.20 $88.00
Product # 70886 Millrose 70886
Product Name Blue PTFE Tape Millrose Tape

C1-2 SUBTOTAL $147.80 $152.60

D Delete

D1 13/16 X 1-5/8” X 10 Ft. Elongated Hole, Single Channel, Pre-Galvanized Carbon Steel 
Model # AS500-EH 2400104705

200

Unit Price $1.22 NO BID
Extended Price $244.00
Product # AS500-EH
Product Name Galvanized Steel Hanger

D2 1-5/8” X 1-5/8” X 10 Ft. Elongated Hole, Single Channel, Pre-Galvanized Carbon Steel 
Model # AS200-EH 2400101305

200

Unit Price $5.08 NO BID
Extended Price $1,016.00
Product # AS200-EH
Product Name Galvanized Steel Hanger

D3 3/8” X 1” Hex Head Cap Screw, Mild Steel
Model # 2400250144

70

Unit Price $0.45 NO BID
Extended Price $31.50
Product # 2400250144
Product Name Hex Cap Screw

D1-3 SUBTOTAL $1,291.50 NO BID

E Delete

E1 3/8 Plated Steel Hex Nut 
Model # 19572

300

Unit Price $0.26 NO BID
Extended Price $78.00
Product # 19572
Product Name Steel hex nut

E2 3/8 Plated Flat Round Washer
Model # 20007

300

Unit Price $0.26 NO BID
Extended Price $78.00
Product # 20007
Product Name Flat washer

E1-2 SUBTOTAL $156.00 NO BID

F Woodford, Or Equal 

Other Items % Markup Above Contractor's Cost NO BID 25%
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Woodford

Specified Items

F1 ¾” Chrome Plated Freezeless Wall Faucet – 3” Wall Thickness, Handwheel, FPT x 
MHT, 125 psi
Model # 24 24P3/4-MH

10

Unit Price $53.08 $51.53
Extended Price $530.80 $515.30
Product # 24P3/4-MH Woodford 24P3/4-MH
Product Name 3/4 Wall faucet Woodford Faucet

F2 ½” Chrome Plated Freezeless Wall Faucet – 3” Wall Thickness, Handwheel, FPT x 
MHT, 125 psi
Model # 24 24P1/2-MH

10

Unit Price $53.08 $53.53
Extended Price $530.80 $535.30
Product # 24P1/2-MH Woodford 24P1/2-MH
Product Name 1/2 Wall faucet Woodford Faucet

F1-2 SUBTOTAL $1,061.60 $1,050.602/4
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G Delete

G1 3” Stainless Steel DWV Heavy Duty Straight Coupling – Husky No Hub
Model # 2000 2008

10

Unit Price $9.20 $9.51
Extended Price $92.00 $95.10
Product # 2000-2008 Everflow 15300
Product Name 3" Steel coupling Everflow Coupling

G2 2” Stainless Steel DWV Heavy Duty Straight Coupling – Husky No Hub 
Model # 2000 2006

10

Unit Price $7.98 $7.47
Extended Price $79.80 $74.70
Product # 2000-2006 Everflow 15200
Product Name 2" Steel coupling Everflow Coupling

G3 4” Stainless Steel DWV Heavy Duty Straight Coupling – Husky No Hub
Model # 2000 2010

10

Unit Price $10.71 $11.76
Extended Price $107.10 $117.60
Product # 2000-2010 Everflow 15400
Product Name 4" Steel coupling Everflow Coupling

G1-3 SUBTOTAL $278.90 $287.40

H Ridgid, Or Equal 

Other Items % Markup Above Contractor's Cost NO BID 10%
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Ridgid

Specified Items

H1 K-50 Sectional Sewer Machine
Model # K50- 58920

10

Unit Price $1,041.36 $1,048.52
Extended Price $10,413.60 $10,485.20
Product # 50- 58920 58920
Product Name Sewer machine Ridgid K-50

H2 K60 Sectional Sewer Machine 
Model # K60SP-66492

10

Unit Price $1,764.63 $1,638.75
Extended Price $17,646.30 $16,387.50
Product # K60SP-66492 66492
Product Name Sewer machine Ridge K-60

H3 Pipe Stand Ball Transfer Head
Model # BTH-9 37997

2

Unit Price $170.28 $158.26
Extended Price $340.56 $316.52
Product # BTH-9 37997 37997
Product Name Ball Transfer Head Ridgid Ball

H4 Measuring Tape
Model # 76822

10

Unit Price N/A $37.25
Extended Price $372.50
Product # 76822
Product Name Ridig Measuring tape

H5 V-Head Pipe Stand
Model # VF-99 22168 

2

Unit Price $95.12 $104.05
Extended Price $190.24 $208.10
Product # VF-99 22168 22168
Product Name V Pipe stand Ridgid

H1-5 SUBTOTAL $28,590.70 $27,769.82

I Delete

I1 G2 Optima Plus 1.28 GPF Water Closet Flushometer
Model # 8111 3250289

10

Unit Price $443.98 $482.08
Extended Price $4,439.80 $4,820.80
Product # 3250289 Sloan 3250289
Product Name G2 Water closet Sloan Flushvalve
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I2 Sloan EAF6A Sensor ASM Hardwire W/O Click (IQ)
Model # 0335004

10

Unit Price $266.92 $280.96
Extended Price $2,669.20 $2,809.60
Product # 0335004 Sloan 0235004
Product Name EAFGA Sensor Sloan Sensor

I3 Sloan 111-1.28 ES-S TMO Water Closet Sensor Flushometer
Model # 3770035

10

Unit Price $381.25 $381.25
Extended Price $3,812.50 $3,812.50
Product # 3770035 Sloan 3770035
Product Name 111 Closet sensor Sloan Flushvalve

I4 Sloan 186-0.5 ES-S TMO Urinal Sensor Flushometer
Model # 3772648

10

Unit Price $381.25 $381.25
Extended Price $3,812.50 $3,812.50
Product # 3772648 Sloan 3772648
Product Name 186 Urinal sensor Sloan Flushvalve

I5 Sloan EAF100-LT-ISM CP ELECT FCT 0.5 GPM (IQ))
Model # 3335140

10

Unit Price $554.06 $583.22
Extended Price $5,540.60 $5,832.20
Product # 3335140 Sloan 3335140
Product Name EAF 100-LT Sloan Faucet

I6 Sloan Solenoid-Faucet
Model # 335001

40

Unit Price $109.31 $118.78
Extended Price $4,372.40 $4,751.20
Product # EAF 2 Faucet 3335001 Sloan 335001
Product Name EAF 2 Solonoid Sloan Solenoid

I7 Sloan EL1218A Repair Kit-Solenoid Actuator
Model # 3305043

50

Unit Price $26.00 $25.15
Extended Price $1,300.00 $1,257.50
Product # 3305043 Sloan 3305043
Product Name EL1218A Repair Kit Sloan Actuator

I1-7 SUBTOTAL $25,947.00 $27,096.30

J Delete

J1 3”, 125/800 Lb, Electrogalvanized, Low Carbon Steel, 2-Piece, Strut to Pipe Clamp
Model # S2009AEG

10

Unit Price $0.86 NO BID
Extended Price $8.60
Product # S2009AEG
Product Name 3" Strut Pipe Clamp

J2 ¾”, 400 Lb, Electrogalvanized, Low Carbon Steel, Pipe to Strut, Strut Clamp
Model # 2003 S2003AEG

50

Unit Price $0.43 NO BID
Extended Price $21.50
Product # 2003 AEG
Product Name 3/4 Strut Clamp

J1-2 SUBTOTAL $30.10 NO BID

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total $76,259.71 $77,276.72
Estimated Annual Award $46,607.41 $28,820.42
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